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SUBMITTAL TO THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS
COUNTY OF RIVERSIDE, STATE OF CALIFORNIA

FROM: Don Kent, Treasurer/Tax Collector SUBMITTAL DATE:

AUG 18 2014

SUBJECT: Recommendation for Distribution of Excess Proceeds for Tax Sale No. 192, tem 334. Last assessed
to: Steven Hilbon and Sherri Phillips, husband and wife as joint tenants. District 5/3 [$7,703] Fund 65595 Excess
Proceeds from Tax Sale.

RECOMMENDED MOTION: That the Board of Supervisors:
1. Approve the claim from Steven Hilbon and Sherri Phiitips, last assessees for payment of excess proceeds
resulting from the Tax Collector's public auction sale associated with parcel 350201033-9,

-+ {continued on page two)

BACKGROUND:

Summary
In accordance with Section 3691 et seq. of the California Revenue and Taxation Code, and with prior approval of Fhe
Board of Supervisors, The Tax Collector conducted the March 20, 2012 public auction sale. The deed conveying

% |tite to the purchasers at the auction was recorded May 11, 2012, Further, as required by Section 4676 of the

California Revenue and Taxation Code, notice of the right to claim excess proceeds was given on June 6, 2012, to
parties of interest as defined in Section 4675 of said code. Parties of interest have been determined by an
examination of lot book reports as well as Assessor's and Recorder’s records, and various research methods were

used to obtain current mailing addresses for these parties of interest.

continued on page two .
( page two) e

A Kent
Treasurer-Tax Collector

FINANCIAL DATA Current Fiscat Yeaf_: NextFiscatYeai: - Total Cost: _ Ongolngcost : zgg%:ﬁaggﬁif
COST $ 7,703 % 0% 7.703| % 0 Consent [ Poicy P
NET COUNTY COST 3 0% 0% 01 8 0
SOURCE OF FUNDS: Fund 65595 Excess Proceeds from Tax Sale Budget Adjustment: N/A
' For Fiscal Year: 14115
C.E.O. RECOMMENDATION: At %
BY: ) C@-ﬂ%/
Karen E-Johnson

County Executive Office Signature

MINUTES OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS

On motion of Supervisor Stone, seconded by Supervisor Jeffries and duly carried, iT
WAS ORDERED that the above matter is approved as recommended.

Ayes: Jeffries, Tavaglione, Stone and Ashley

Nays: None Kecia Harper-ihem
Absent: Benoit Clerkaf ar
Date: September 23, 2014 By:

XC: Treasurer, Auditor Deputy

Prev. Agn. Ref.: | District: 5/3 | Agenda Number: 9 1 5
g
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SUBMITTAL TO THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS, COUNTY OF RIVERSIDE, STATE OF CALIFORNIA

FORM 11: Recommendation for Distribution of Excess Proceeds for Tax Sale No. 192, [tem 334. Last assessed to:

Steven Hilbon and Sherri Phillips, husband and wife as joint tenants. District 5/3 [$7,703] Fund 65595 Excess Proceeds
from Tax Sale.

DATE:
PAGE: Page 2 of 2

RECOMMENDED MOTION:

2. Authorize and direct the Auditor-Controller to issue a warrant to Steven Hitbon and Sherri Phillips in the amount
of $7,703.58 no sooner than ninety days from the date of this order, unless an appeal has been filed in
Superior Courf, pursuant to the California Revenue and Taxation Code Section 4675.

BACKGROUND:
Summary {continued)

The Treasurer-Tax Collector has received one claim for excess proceeds:

1. Claim from Steven Hilbon and Sherri Phillips based on a Grant Deed recorded November 10, 2011 as
Instrument No. 2011-0503317.

Pursuant to Section 4675 (a) of the California Revenue and Taxation Code, it is the recommendation of this office that
Steven Hilbon and Sherri Phillips be awarded excess proceeds in the amount of $7,703.58. Supporting documentation
has been provided. The Tax Collector requests approval of the above recommended motion.

Impact on Citizens and Businesses
Excess proceeds are being released to the last assessees of the property.

ATTACHMENTS (if needed, in this order):

A copy of the Excess Proceeds Claim form and SUpporting documentaticn is attached.
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CLAIM FOR EXCESS PROCEEDS FROM THE SALE OF TAX-DEFAULTED PROPERTY
(SEE REVERSE SIDE FOR FURTHER INSTRUCTIONS)

To: Don Kent, Treasurer-Tax Collector

Re: Ciaim for Excess Proceeds

TC 192 ltem 334 Assessment No.. 350201033-2 (
Assessee: GIBBY, RICHARD D X

Situs: 23944 LAKE DR CANYON LAKE
Date Sold: March 20, 2012

Date Deed to Purchaser Recarded: May 11, 2012

gl 0wy i 130218l
10
2

Final Date to Submit Claim; May 13, 2013 v

I’We, pursuant to Revenue and Taxation Code Section 4675, he

_ , hereby claim excess proceeds in the amount of
$ Fi&f .%% from the sale of the above mentioned real property. @were the [ lienhotder(s)

property owner{s} [check in one box] at the time of the sale of the property as is evidenced by Riverside County
Recorder's Document No. 2oil = aS0 3317 - recorded on fi~ I12-2a}3y . A copy of this document is attached here to.
/We are the rightful claimants by virtue of the attached assignment of interest

. 1/We have listed below and attached
hereto each item of documentation supporting the claim submitted

NOTE: YOUR CLAIM WILL NOT BE CONSIDERED UNLESS THE DOCUMENTATION IS ATTACHED

If the property is held in Joint Tenancy, the taxsale process has severed this Joint Tenancy, and all Joint Tenants will

have to sign the claim unless the claimant submits proof that he or she is entitled to the full amount of the claim, the
claimant may only receive his or her respective portion of the claim.

I"We affirm under penalty of perjury that the foregoing is true and correct.

Executed this “ tday of _0C TepeN
Sig natuﬂéﬁt Wm

CTeves g od

20lL at ﬂt"dSts’?e ¢ A .
_ County f

L.

Signatu're of Claimant

: St Pricps

Print Name Print Name

v oA DRE Lflti EodA DLW
Street Address Street Address

LALINA plins C}( SR l-fA\'f»UN'f\ o t(ixud-* A G 1‘(0')')
City, State, Zip / City, State, Zip

GHA- (a+?-oua} O S R 22

Phone Number Phone Number

5C0 8-21 (1-89)
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RECORDING REQUEST l..rry W. Mard
M 2 e =D8Y i County Clerk & Recordar

Bigven Hibon
WHEN RECORDED MAIL 7O - | '“ “m“ |H Hm m mn H“ m “mm tlll
AND ML TAX STATEMENTS TO -
S PAGE LA | MISC CoPY
Steven Hitban i

q

w1 A | L | 465 | 426 \PCORNNCOR| SMF |NCHG DXAM

242475 Rhore Drive

Lagune Niguel, CA 92677 o R e 53
A feps Tedl I crv | un o
_ GRANT DEED
TITLE ORDER NG ESCROW NO. APNNO. 160-204-017, 350-203-033, 150.201-038
373114037, 33004 C
THE UNDERSIGNED GRANTGR{s} DECLARE!s)
%oﬂumsrgdm &mnltsrga TAX is $_ ot to be public record GITY TAKS 3
compuied oh il valug or vas of Bens of encurrhr reTYaln iitne o a8,
B oot mos: (] bfr?moonwwd Dmmdmfullvﬂue value o fann:nsd ing al ipe of 283

FOR A VALUABLE CONSIDERATION, receipt of which is hereby acknowledget,

Richard Gikhy, 2 Marred ARG &3 s sole and separate property

hereby GRANT(s) o

Steven Hilbon snd Sherri Philtips, husband and wife as joint tenents

the foliowing described real propeity in the County of  Riverside Stale of Catifomial
SEE ATTACHED EXHIBIT A

Dated //’%’Zﬂ//

Richard Gibby

State of California

County of____ QUQN

O Elmtxrlu Pauel] notary public persenally
sppeared___¥ywhom ('mhm who proved to me on

the basis of sat'sfaci-w pvidénda 1o be the person{.s} whose name) (olere subscribed to the within instrument and
acknowledged 1o me hat @‘r‘-&‘they executed the same in (Eherwlr authorized capacity{ies), and that py(hirmerhelr

gigiaabJret; on the instrurment the person{s}, or the entity upon behalf of which the personig} acted, exacutied e
HIsrLirnen

! certify under PENALTY OF PERJURY under the laws of the State of California that the foregoing paragraph is
trua and correct.

WITNESS ry heged and pfficial seal,
Signature , /M (Seal)

KIMBERLY POWELL
Commission # 1883112 1
Notary Public - California 2

Drange County =

My Comm, Expires Jun 4, 2014



LEGAL DESCRIPTION
EX+HusiT A

The land referred to herein is sitnated in the State of Califernia, County of Riverside, City of Menifee,
and described as follows:

Parcel A: 350-201-017-3

Lot{s) {7 of Block P of Lake Eisinore Lodge, County of Riverside, State of California, as shown by map on
file in Book 12 Page(s) 28, of Maps, Records of Riverside County, California.

Parcel B: 350.201-033-9 and 350-201-034-0

Lot(s) 33 and 34, Block P, Tract 2 of Lake Elsinore Lodge, as shown by map on file in Book 12 Page{s) 28,
of Maps, Records of Riverside County, California.

Parce) C: 373-111-027-3

Lot(s} 8 of Country Club Heights Unit 4, in the City of Lake Elsinore, County of Riverside, State of

California, as shown by map on file in Book 12 Page(s) 30, of Maps, Records of Riverside County,
California.

Parcel D 373-114-004-1

Lot(s} 8 in Block 2 of Country Club Heights No. 1, as shown by map on file in Book 11 Page(s) 18, of Maps,
Records of Riverside County, California.

(End of Legal Description)

File Number: 376729 Fage 3of 1]

11/168/2811 11:39AR
g of 4



[ [ -~

FRDM:'

e —p———a st tmart Romre «

'Stevep L Hilbon ) ' PHONE NO. : 949 €43 6263 Jun. 18 2014 B@3:28FM P2

DECLARATION

{ Richard D. Gibby declare by my notarized signature below
that 1 am one and the same as Richard Gibby who executed
the Grant Deed on November 4, 2011 to Steven Hitbon and
Sherri Phillips husband and wife as joint Etenants and
recorded in the Riverside County public records as
instrument number 2011-0503317 on November 10, 2011.

Dat,eéd /’Z JZ&/%

Richard D. Gibby

State df California

Cmmty‘glf ‘3&%}%\4 — —beforg e I I\HCC&\ q P%LELE‘Y notary pubic

personally appeared who proved 1o me on
the basis of satisfactory e\ﬂdence to be the erson whbée nanggé) is/gfe subscribed to the within
instrument and acknowledged to me that they executed thé same in @i/heritheir authorized
capacity(igs), and that b " hear/their signatu on the ingtrument the personMr the entity upon

behalf of which the person(s acted, executed the instrument.

i carmy under PENALTY OF PERJURY under the laws of the Sta‘ha of California that the foregoing
paragraph is true and correct.

WITNESS my hand ang offi célzea :
Signature E\—)\(} 569. /l {Seal)

NIGOLE PFEIFFER
Commisston # 1917010

Notary Public - California
San Diego County
My Comm. Expires Dec 13 2014




unmrunm‘ Recorder

| COUNTYOFRIVERSIDE = . Howmiae Casasoronst
ASSESSOR-COUNTY CLERK-RECORDER (931) 485-7000
- http:firiversido. sercleras com
CERTIFICATIOE

Pursuant to the provisions of Government Code 27381.7, | cerllfy under the penalty of perjury
that the’ follouﬂng Is a true copy of lllagible wordlng found in the attached document: -

SEE ATTACHMENT
| | OR : o
SEE ATTACHED FOR CLARITY

Date: |- to- ?/.OH

 Signature: _%J _

Print Name: §—{—e\,@h | H—\ ‘L(ﬂ.\ | . |
commsence, [T 257




RECORDING REQUESTED BY
Steven Hilbons

WHEN RECORDED MAI. TO
AND MAIL TAX STATEMENTS TO
Steven Hithon

24241 Rhona Drive

Laguna Niguel, CA 92477

GRANT DEED

TITLE ORDER NO. ESCROW NO. APN NO.  350-201-017, 350-201-033, 350-201-034
: T 3TRIT027, 373114004

THE UNDERSIGNED GRANTOR(s) DECLARE (s)
DOCUMENTARY TRANSFER TAX is $__nvot t be public record CITY TAXS,
gqumdmm,wﬂmmmwmmdmammm&mdm
Unincorporatad emsa: [ City of , and

FOR A VALUABLE CONSIDERATION, receipt of which is hereby acknowledged.

Richard Gibby, 8 married man as his sole and separste property

hereby GRANT(s) io '

Steven Hithon and Sherri Philflips, husband and wife 2s joint tenants

the following described real property in the County of  Riverside State of Catifornia:

SEE ATTACHED EXHIBIT A
Dated
: Richard Gibby
State of California
County of .
On hafore me notary public personally

appeared who proved fo me on
the basis of sabsTactory eviGenoe to be the person(s) whose name(s) is/are subscribed to the within instrument and

to me that he/she/they executed the same in his/hestheir authorized capacity(ies), and that by hisher/their
signature(s) on the instrument the person(s), or the entity upon behalf of which the person(s) acted, executed the
instrument :

1 certify under PENALTY OF PERJURY under the laws of the State of California that the foregoing paragraph is
true and cormect
WITNESS my hand and official seal.

Signature (Seal)

117182811 11:39R
4 of 4
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COUNTY OF RIVERSIDE
OFFICE OF THE TREASURER-TAX COLLECTCR
SALE CF TAX DEFAULTED PROPERTY - TC192

MARCH 20, 2012

Page 8

ASSESSMENT# STATUS SALE PRICE
350111039-7 SOLD $2,473.00
350111040-7 NO BID
350111041-8 NO BID
350111049-6 SOLD $2,497.00
3501120334 NO BID
350112036-7 REDEEMED
350113004~ NO BID
350113018-2 NO BID
350122026-9 NO BID
350133005-4 NO BID
350133006-5 NO BiD
350134008-0 SOLD $2,585.00
350153010-0 NO BLD
35015630111 NOC BID
3501530144 NO BID
350182003-4 S0LD $11.000.00
350193003-8 NGO BID
350193041-2 SO n w _
350201033-9 SOLD $14.000.00
3502010340 SOLD $10,000.00
350202026-6 NO BID
380202038-7 NO BID
350203006-1 SOLD $2.,900.00
350203052-2 REDEEMED
3502110Q7-7 NO BID
350211026-4 NG BID
350212002-5 REDEEMED
350214042-7 SOLD $2,300.00
3502220071 NQ BID
3502220279 SOLD $2,900.00
3502220356 SOLD $8,000.00
350223008-5 NO BID
350231004-6 NO BID
350231018-0 REDEEMED
350231051-8 SOLD $10,000.00

| 350233010-7 SOLD $9,500.00
350244028-8 REDEEMED '
350244029-9 OFF SALE
350244030-9 OFF SALE
350244031-0 REDEEMED
350244047-5 QFF SALE
350244048-6 OFF SALE
350244040-7 REDEEMED
350245004-9 REDEEMED
350253008-8 NO BID
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333[350193041-2  {026-172[IN THE CITY OF MENIFEE 2006-350193041-0000 | 2,489.00
334/350201033-9 026-172 IN THE CITY OF MENIFEE {4k L 12006-350201033-0000 |  5872.00
335]350201034-0 026-172 |IN THE CITY OF MENIFEE -—12006-350201034-0000 3,477.00!
336|350202026-6 026-172 [IN THE CITY OF MENIFEE 2006-350202026-0000 | 3,481.00
337|350202038-7 026-172 [IN THE CITY OF MENIFEE 2006-350202038-0000 3,712.00
338|350203006-1 026-172 |IN THE CITY OF MENIFEE 2004-350203006-0000 | 1,719.00
33%350203052-2 026-172 |IN THE CITY OF MENIFEE 12006-350203052-0000 (L -5,008.00]
340/350211007-7 026-172 |IN THE CITY OF MENIFEE ¢ A< ]2006-350211007-0000 4,336.00
341]350211026-4 026-172 |IN THE CITY OF MENIFEE o/XsS |2008-350211026-0000 4,031.00
350212002-5  |026-172 |IN THE CITY OF MENIFEE T 12008-350212002-0000 /L 2,676-061
3431350214042-7 026-172 |iN THE CITY OF MENIFEE 7.\ 0| 1989-350214042-0000 ~616-00]
| 344350222007-1 026-172 [IN THE CITY OF MENIFEE PATS 2008-350222007-0000 4,589.00
345/350222027-9 026-172 IN THE CITY OF MENIFEE 1, 2. 14 u |1992-350222027-0000 / ¢ 730.00} -
3461350222035-6 026-172 ]IN THE CITY OF MENIFEE &\ |2006-350222035-0000 13,188.00
347|350223008-5 026-172 iN THE CITY OF MENIFEE /%5 |2006-350223008-0000 | 4,628.00|
348/350231004-6  [026-172 ]IN THE CITY OF MENIFEE P X3y |2006-350231004-0000 2275.00
 349/350231019-0  |026-172 IN THE CITY OF MENIFEE 2006-350231019-0000 2,511.00
350|350231051-8 026-172 iN THE CITY OF MENIFEE ] oK |2008-350231051-0000 4,654.00
3511350233010-7 026-172 :IN THE CITY OF MENIFEE 4 ¢op |2004-350233010-0000 ~1,719.00
7 352[350244028-8  [026-172IN THE CITY OF MENIFEE 2006-350244028-0000 3.815.00
| 3531350244029-9  |026-172 IN THE CITY OF MENIFEE |2006-350244028-0000 £ 3,408-00
 3647350244030-9 _ |026-172|IN THE CITY OF MENIFEE 7 12006-350244030-0000 /4. 310800
355|350244031-0 026-172 |IN THE CITY OF MENIFEE _ |2006-350244031-0000 _ 3,815.00
3561350244047-5 026-172 [IN THE CITY OF MENIFEE T T12006-350244027-0000 [T _3,760.00
2573502440486 026-172 |iN THE CITY OF MENIFEE T 12006-350244037-0003 /4. 2,786.80
~358(350244049-7 026-172 INTHE CITY OF MENIFEE 2006-350244037-0002 {l. 2786.00]
3567350245004-9 026-172 |IN THE CITY OF MENIFEE 2006-350245004-0000 [ -3,806-80]

...... "360/350253008-8 026-172 |IN THE CiTY OF MENIFEE TAZ> i2008-350253008-0000 |~ 3,165.00
__ 350261042-3  |026-172 |IN THE CITY OF MENIFEE 2006-350261042-0000 {4 274000
362|350281025-0 026-172 |IN THE CITY OF MENIFEE " yk%s |2008-350281025-0000 |  5,966.00
363,350284003-9 026-172 [IN THE CITY OF MENIFEE " 1< |2006-350284003-0000 2,883.00
364|351043001-9 026-172 [IN THE CITY OF MENIFEE __ { AL, &% |2006-351043001-0000 10,468.00
365|351062020-5 026-172 |IN THE CITY OF MENIFEE g%~ 12008-361062020-0000 7,571.00
366/351121006-5 026-172 |iN THE CITY OF MENIFEE Y ALS [2006-351121006-0000 | 6,231.00
367{351121017-5 026-172[IN THE CITY OF MENIFEE {ALS |2006-351121017-0000 |  4,936.00

| 368(351122004-6 [026-172|INTHECITY OF MENIFEE ___~ __|2006-351122004-0000 /41 ~B435:00)]
369|353022005-2 023-003 |IN THE CITY OF CANYON LAKE ‘¢ ¢ S 12006-353022005-0000 18,807.00

Page 10
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